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From: Maccarone, Susan < @effem.com>
Sent: Thursday, 15 November 2012 6:46 AM
To: Jacquie Rand
Cc: Hurley, Karyl
Subject: RE: Waiting On Invoice

Sure. Thank you for your continued support! Have a great evening. 
 
Kind Regards, 
 

Susan Maccarone 

Global Scientific & Regulatory Affairs 

Operations Specialist 

 

 
Office
Mobile
Email: @effem.com 
 

 
The Information contained in this e‐mail, and any files transmitted with it, is confidential and may be legally 
privileged. It is intended solely for the addressee. If you are not the intended recipient, please return the message by 
replying to it and then delete the message from your computer. Any disclosure, copying, distribution or action taken 
in reliance on its contents is prohibited and may be unlawful. 
 

From: Jacquie Rand [mailto:j.rand@uq.edu.au]  
Sent: Wednesday, November 14, 2012 3:33 PM 
To: Maccarone, Susan 
Cc: Hurley, Karyl 
Subject: RE: Waiting On Invoice 
 
Hi Susan, 
Thank you for letting me know. I have followed up with an urgent message to find out where hold‐up has been. 
Can you let me know in 2 weeks if it has not been received. 
Thanks, 
 
 
Jacquie 
 
Jacquie Rand 
Professor of Companion Animal Health 
Director, Centre for Companion Animal Health 
School of Veterinary Science 
The University of Queensland 
St. Lucia, QLD 4072  
Australia 
CRICOS Provider Number 00025B 
Ph: (61) 07 3365 2122 
Fax: (61)07 3346 9822 
Email: j.rand@uq.edu.au 
Website: www.uq.edu.au/ccah 
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From: Maccarone, Susan [mailto: @effem.com]  
Sent: Thursday, 15 November 2012 12:40 AM 
To: Jacquie Rand 
Cc: Hurley, Karyl 
Subject: Waiting On Invoice 
 
Hello, 
 
I’m sorry to inform you that we still have not yet received the invoice for the Waltham Foundation Grant. We must 
have this invoice asap as year‐end is coming quickly. If we do not use the grants in 2012 we may lose the 
opportunity to assist your University. 
 
I recognize that you have already followed up in the past with no success, but if you can follow up again, I would 
appreciate it.  
 
 
 
Kind Regards, 
 

Susan Maccarone 

Global Scientific & Regulatory Affairs 

Operations Specialist 

 

 
Office: 
Mobile
Email:  @effem.com 
 

 
The Information contained in this e‐mail, and any files transmitted with it, is confidential and may be legally 
privileged. It is intended solely for the addressee. If you are not the intended recipient, please return the message by 
replying to it and then delete the message from your computer. Any disclosure, copying, distribution or action taken 
in reliance on its contents is prohibited and may be unlawful. 
 

From: Jacquie Rand [mailto:j.rand@uq.edu.au]  
Sent: Thursday, October 18, 2012 5:13 PM 
To: Maccarone, Susan 
Subject: RE: Invoice Preparation 
 
Dear Susan, 
I am puzzled why the University hasn’t actioned this but have asked that it be actioned ASAP. 
Thank you for your follow up. 
Kind regards, 
 
 
Jacquie 
 
Jacquie Rand 
Professor of Companion Animal Health 
Director, Centre for Companion Animal Health 
School of Veterinary Science 
The University of Queensland 
St. Lucia, QLD 4072  
Australia 
CRICOS Provider Number 00025B 
Ph: (61) 07 3365 2122 
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Fax: (61)07 3346 9822 
Email: j.rand@uq.edu.au 
Website: www.uq.edu.au/ccah 
 

From: Maccarone, Susan [mailto @effem.com]  
Sent: Thursday, 18 October 2012 11:37 PM 
To: Jacquie Rand 
Cc: Hurley, Karyl 
Subject: RE: Invoice Preparation 
 
Dr. Rand, good morning. 
 
I apologize for contacting you again, however we have not yet received your invoice for the Waltham Foundation 
Grant. Can you please have the invoice submitted as soon as possible to my attention. 
 
 
 
Kind Regards, 
 

Susan Maccarone 

Global Scientific & Regulatory Affairs 

Operations Specialist 

 

 
Office:
Mobile
Email @effem.com 
 

 
The Information contained in this e‐mail, and any files transmitted with it, is confidential and may be legally 
privileged. It is intended solely for the addressee. If you are not the intended recipient, please return the message by 
replying to it and then delete the message from your computer. Any disclosure, copying, distribution or action taken 
in reliance on its contents is prohibited and may be unlawful. 
 

From: Maccarone, Susan  
Sent: Thursday, August 23, 2012 1:17 PM 
To: 'j.rand@uq.edu.au' 
Cc: Hurley, Karyl 
Subject: Invoice Preparation 
 
Hello Dr. Rand! 
 
I’m pleased to inform you that all of the necessary documentation and agreements have been now been finalized. 
When you are ready, please prepare an invoice and address it as follows:  
 
Mars, Incorporated 
Attn: Dr. Steven W. Rizk, Ph.D. 
6885 Elm Street 
McLean VA 22101 USA 
 
PON # 000674 
 
Once completed, please forward an electronic version of the invoice to @effem.com, and copy both 
myself and Karyl Hurley. 
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If in the meantime you have any questions, or need further assistance, please do not hesitate to let me know as I’m 
more than happy to assist you. 
 
Enjoy your day! 
 
 
Kind Regards, 
 

Susan Maccarone 

Global Scientific & Regulatory Affairs 

Operations Specialist 

 

 
Work: 
Mobile
Email: @effem.com 
 

 
The Information contained in this e‐mail, and any files transmitted with it, is confidential and may be legally 
privileged. It is intended solely for the addressee. If you are not the intended recipient, please return the message by 
replying to it and then delete the message from your computer. Any disclosure, copying, distribution or action taken 
in reliance on its contents is prohibited and may be unlawful. 
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From: Maccarone, Susan < @effem.com>
Sent: Thursday, 15 November 2012 9:35 PM
To: Jacquie Rand
Cc: Hurley, Karyl
Subject: Received Invoice

Dr. Rand,  
 
I wanted to let you know that I have received the invoice finally! I’m not sure what you had to do, but I’m grateful 
that we are now able to support the University with this Grant. 
 
Have a wonderful day, and thank you again. 
 
Kind Regards, 
 

Susan Maccarone 

Global Scientific & Regulatory Affairs 

Operations Specialist 

 

 
Office: 
Mobile
Email: @effem.com 
 

 
The Information contained in this e‐mail, and any files transmitted with it, is confidential and may be legally 
privileged. It is intended solely for the addressee. If you are not the intended recipient, please return the message by 
replying to it and then delete the message from your computer. Any disclosure, copying, distribution or action taken 
in reliance on its contents is prohibited and may be unlawful. 
 

From: Maccarone, Susan  
Sent: Wednesday, November 14, 2012 9:40 AM 
To: 'Jacquie Rand' 
Cc: Hurley, Karyl 
Subject: Waiting On Invoice 
 
Hello, 
 
I’m sorry to inform you that we still have not yet received the invoice for the Waltham Foundation Grant. We must 
have this invoice asap as year‐end is coming quickly. If we do not use the grants in 2012 we may lose the 
opportunity to assist your University. 
 
I recognize that you have already followed up in the past with no success, but if you can follow up again, I would 
appreciate it.  
 
 
 
Kind Regards, 
 

Susan Maccarone 

Global Scientific & Regulatory Affairs 

Operations Specialist 
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Office:
Mobile:
Email: @effem.com 
 

 

 
The Information contained in this e‐mail, and any files transmitted with it, is confidential and may be legally 
privileged. It is intended solely for the addressee. If you are not the intended recipient, please return the message by 
replying to it and then delete the message from your computer. Any disclosure, copying, distribution or action taken 
in reliance on its contents is prohibited and may be unlawful. 
 

From: Jacquie Rand [mailto:j.rand@uq.edu.au]  
Sent: Thursday, October 18, 2012 5:13 PM 
To: Maccarone, Susan 
Subject: RE: Invoice Preparation 
 
Dear Susan, 
I am puzzled why the University hasn’t actioned this but have asked that it be actioned ASAP. 
Thank you for your follow up. 
Kind regards, 
 
 
Jacquie 
 
Jacquie Rand 
Professor of Companion Animal Health 
Director, Centre for Companion Animal Health 
School of Veterinary Science 
The University of Queensland 
St. Lucia, QLD 4072  
Australia 
CRICOS Provider Number 00025B 
Ph: (61) 07 3365 2122 
Fax: (61)07 3346 9822 
Email: j.rand@uq.edu.au 
Website: www.uq.edu.au/ccah 
 

From: Maccarone, Susan [mailto @effem.com]  
Sent: Thursday, 18 October 2012 11:37 PM 
To: Jacquie Rand 
Cc: Hurley, Karyl 
Subject: RE: Invoice Preparation 
 
Dr. Rand, good morning. 
 
I apologize for contacting you again, however we have not yet received your invoice for the Waltham Foundation 
Grant. Can you please have the invoice submitted as soon as possible to my attention. 
 
 
 
Kind Regards, 
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Susan Maccarone 

Global Scientific & Regulatory Affairs 

Operations Specialist 

 

 
Office:
Mobile:
Email: @effem.com 
 

 
The Information contained in this e‐mail, and any files transmitted with it, is confidential and may be legally 
privileged. It is intended solely for the addressee. If you are not the intended recipient, please return the message by 
replying to it and then delete the message from your computer. Any disclosure, copying, distribution or action taken 
in reliance on its contents is prohibited and may be unlawful. 
 

From: Maccarone, Susan  
Sent: Thursday, August 23, 2012 1:17 PM 
To: 'j.rand@uq.edu.au' 
Cc: Hurley, Karyl 
Subject: Invoice Preparation 
 
Hello Dr. Rand! 
 
I’m pleased to inform you that all of the necessary documentation and agreements have been now been finalized. 
When you are ready, please prepare an invoice and address it as follows:  
 
Mars, Incorporated 
Attn: Dr. Steven W. Rizk, Ph.D. 
6885 Elm Street 
McLean VA 22101 USA 
 
PON # 000674 
 
Once completed, please forward an electronic version of the invoice t @effem.com, and copy both 
myself and Karyl Hurley. 
 
If in the meantime you have any questions, or need further assistance, please do not hesitate to let me know as I’m 
more than happy to assist you. 
 
Enjoy your day! 
 
 
Kind Regards, 
 

Susan Maccarone 

Global Scientific & Regulatory Affairs 

Operations Specialist 

 

 
Work: 
Mobile:
Email: @effem.com 
 

 
The Information contained in this e‐mail, and any files transmitted with it, is confidential and may be legally 
privileged. It is intended solely for the addressee. If you are not the intended recipient, please return the message by 
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replying to it and then delete the message from your computer. Any disclosure, copying, distribution or action taken 
in reliance on its contents is prohibited and may be unlawful. 
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